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Architectural cducation as we know it today began to take shape 
during the Enlightenment codification of societal power relations in 
thc lateeighteenth century. This relationship is expressed in Claude 
Nicholas Ledoux's engraving of the auditorium of the Theater of 
Besanqon reflected in theeye of the architect. This image constructs 
a "reciprocal relationship" between authority and society through a 
social contract in which authority is given over to leaders who, in 
turn, are responsible for reflecting society's will. The boundaries of 
contemporary architectural education exist within the limits of these 
reciprocally constructed cones of vision. 

Although an acknowledgment of the complex, global, and com- 
petitive qualities of architectural practice is often behind recent calls 
forthe "professionalization" ofeducation, thesecalls rarely consider 
how major shifts in the boundaries of architecture might require a 
radical rethinking of the structure of architectural education. Archi- 
tecture schools must confront the challenges of this new environ- 
ment through a willingness to both educate students who may not 
continue on to receive a professional degree and to expand profes- 
sional education to include practices once deemed outside the 
boundaries of architecture. This paper will offer a proposal for such 
a restructuring. 

INTRODUCTION 

The stakes in the border war have been the territories of 
production, reproduction, and imagination. This chapter is an 
argument for pleas~lre in the confusion of boundaries and for 
responsibiliry in their con~tmct ion.~ 

- Donna Haraway 
Simians, Cyborgs, and Women 

Architectural education as we know it today began to take shape 
during the period of the Enlightenment codification of societal 
powcr relations in the late eighteenth century. This relationship is 
expressed inClaude Nicholas Ledoux's engraving of the auditorium 
of the Theater of Besan~on  reflected in the eye of the architect. 
Ledoux's image constructs a "reciprocal relationship" between 
authority and society through a social contract in which authority is 
given over to leaders who, in turn, are responsible for reflecting 
society's wilL2 Our traditional models of architectural practice exist 
in the space defined by this gaze, implying not only that the architect 
is capable of knowing the will of society and through the vehicle of 
architecture responding to it, but also that what constitutes an 
appropriateresponse iscarefully circumscribed. Similarly, the bound- 
aries of architectural education exist within the limits of these 
reciprocally constructed cones of vision. They are codified in the 
legal control of the title "architect," the desire to bring all schools 
under a single accreditation system, and the devaluation of the 
license to practice architecture to an increasingly mechanized ex- 

Fig. I. C-N Ledoux, L'Architecture considerre sous le rapport dr  I'art des 
moeurs ct de la legislation (Paris, 1804). 

amination of the ability to protect "health, safety, and welfare." 
This rellexive perspective is also prcsent in the United States in 

recent calls to makc architectural education more closely mirror 
architectural practice. Such proposals typically decrease the class- 
room and studio components of university-based education in favor 
of an increase in "cooperative" and "practice-studio" education. 
Under such proposals the educational system built in the ninetcenth- 
century to legitimate architecture as a profession is dismantled in the 
late-twentieth-century to become more transparent to the profes- 
sion.'The acknowledgment of the complex, global, and competitive 
qualitics of architectural practice is most often behind the calls for 
the renewed "professionalization" of education. Robert Gutman 
writes: "I see only one solution to these difficulties, and that is to 
reduce the role of the schools in the educational process and give a 
more central role to practices."Wowever, the fragmented global 
environment, which also includes a growth of possibilities for 
architectural practice, might require a looser fit between the schools 
and the profession. This paper will argue for a reformulation of 
architectural education to construct a more diverse structure for 
tackling the multiple fields in which and upon which architecture is 
practiced today. 

It is not necessarily clear that the best and brightest students enter 
or remain in the profession of archi tec t~re .~  Every year schools of 
architecture graduate more studcnts than the profession can absorb. 
despite phenomenal attrition rates within the schools themselves. 
Architects tend to be proud of their own professional brand of Social 
Darwinism, aunique blend of self- and natural-selection. According 
to this myth intensecornpetition keeps standards high. Each year the 
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dimensions of required knowledge and the responsibility of the 
architect expand, the demands put upon schools for accreditation 
become more sophisticated, and the requirements for licensing 
become more demanding and constrained. While these may be good 
things in their own right, they ignore another fact: the boundaries of 
practice are blurring and, therefore, the scope of possibilities for 
architecture enlarging. 1 would like to consider what these transfor- 
mations imply for the structure of architectural education and the 
content of architectural pedagogy. In my conclusion I will offer a 
proposal for this restructuring that addresses three issues: first, that 
there are purposes for receiving an undergraduate education in the 
discipline of architecture even if this education does not lead to a 
professional degree; second, that as architectural practice restruc- 
tures in response to the globalization of the economy new research- 
basedgraduate programs should beestablished; and third, that as the 
scope of architectural practice expands we should aim for a more 
diverse assemblage of graduate programs. 

DISCIPLINARY BOUNDARIES AND THE GLOBAL 
ENVIRONMENT OF ARCHITECTURE 

The way we think about architecture is always organized by the 
way we think about boundaries. Traditionally it is a matter of 
walls dividing inside from outside, public from private, and so 
on. With modernity there is a displacement of the traditional 
sense of an inside as an enclosed space established in opposi- 
tion to the outside. All boundaries are ~hif t ing.~ 

Theconcept of adiscipline, or a "field of study" is defined as much 
by its boundaries, and the rules that regulate those boundaries as by 
its contents. Specific perspectives order what a discipline contains 
and how it is delimited.7 Numerous authors have chronicled the 
development of architecture into a distinct profession in the nine- 
teenth century to legitimate and codify a specific set of design 
practices within industrial societies in Europe and the United States8 
Today, a complex relationship among schools, the profession, and 
various regulatory agencies delineates who may call him or herself 
an architect and by extension what practices are properly defined as 
architectural. 

As the practice of architecture expanded in the twentieth century 
efforts to control and organize production became more complex. 
Modern architectural practice in the United States after World War 
I1 was structured by hierarchical control and oversight and was 
dominated by large firms. While Walter Gropius' conception of 
practice sought to bring together collaborative teams of diverse 
individuals under the leadership of the architect, in practice large 
corporate firms, exemplified by Skidmore, Owings, and Merrill, 
offered total design services through a hierarchical and highly 
differentiated office of design professionals.'This multidisciplinarity 
operated serially and tended to reinforce rather than redefine the 
divisions between design tasks. Firms of this kind were not only 
capable of carefully controlling their product, they were also able to 
export this standardized product worldwide. 

With the advent and dissemination of information technologies 
and socioeconomic restructuring in the 1970s and 1980s an environ- 
ment for interdisciplinary practice begins to take shape. Urban 
planner Manuel Castells describes this restructured environment as 
a "space of flows," an organization of informational technologies 
detached from the "historically constructed space of places."1° 
Geographers such as Edward Soja have described the affect of this 
restructuring on thedesign of the urbanenvironment." But there has 
also been a significant effect on architectural practice. Among other 
things these restructurings result in the flexible patterns of work and 
focus on information gathering and processing12 that have trans- 
formed all scales of architectural practice in the past two decades.I3 

This restructuring does not in and of itself produce interdiscipli- 
nary work, although it does make such work more viable. Even large 
multidisciplinary firms no longerproduceprojectsexclusively within 

their own offices. But in addition to the reorganization of practice. 
new practices have also begun to emerge that do not fall neatly within 
the traditional boundaries of the profession of architecture. Some of 
these opportunities include: community development and empow- 
erment, public policy, planning and zoning, ecological concerns and 
the environment, installation practices, artistic practices, curatorial 
work, publishing and criticism, and preservation. The greatest 
opportunity may lie in the electronic/virtual environment with its 
potential toaffecttheshape ofphysical environments,not to mention 
thedesignof this environment as aspatial and notjust graphic realm. 
Further, the "space of flows" is an environment that can and should 
be considered in an enlarged definition of the discipline of architec- 
ture. For example, work once considered "alternative" in the "Young 
Architects" issues of Progressive Architecture magazine is now 
embraced by Arclzitecture magazine as redefining the profession. 
This can be seen in the increasing number of pages that focus on 
practices concerned with the design of the virtual environment. 
Architecture firms are involved in advanced rendering and anima- 
tion, website design and interactive communication, and "space- 
planning" that resolves the interaction of both physical and virtual 
space. 

The permeability of boundaries caused by new technologies and 
the global environment undermines clearly circumscribed power 
and social relationships such as that described by Ledoux's image. 
Within architecture this allows for a diversification of the profession 
and the creation of new forms of practice. But as architectural 
theorist Beatriz Colomina notes: "[t]hroughout this century, this 
disturbance of boundaries has often been understood as a threat to 
identity, a loss of self,"'"lthough Colomina is speaking of the 
status of the architectural object, her statement can be extended to 
architectural practice. By implication, as the boundaries of a disci- 
pline become more permeable, the desire of the profession to control 
them increases. This is clearly happening in the profession's in- 
creased self-regulation but is also the case in its increased attempts 
to regulate the schools. 

The writings of feminist authors offer some insight into this 
proces~. '~  Donna Haraway writes: 

I prefer a network ideological image, suggesting the profusion 
of spaces and identities and the permeability of boundaries in 
the personal body and in the body politic. "Networking" is both 
a feminist practice and a multinational corporate strategy - 
weaving is for oppositional cyborgs.I6 

These "boundary practices" recall the marginal existence common 
to women, and several authors have noted thesimilarity between the 
reactionary response to this expansion and permeability of bound- 
aries as a "fear of the feminine," a condition out of control: 

In practice, architects have entered new territories; they are 
designing film sets, furniture, LP covers; they are retraining as 
schoolteachers, space-planning advisors, brief writers, com- 
munity advisers, management contractors and developers; they 
are writing, drawing, makinginstallations, inventingnew tricks, 
selling themselves, their wares, their images. ... to sell himself 
in the global marketplace, the "old boy" must be fragmented, 
moulded and reconstructed as a "new girl."17 

The desire to control the means of architecture's reproduction (the 
schools) exists in a context where the profession is losing control of 
the means of production. In this respect the profession is not unlike 
a "gated community" in which increasingly repressive walls limit 
who may enter and exit the physical space of the community, but not 
the information and knowledge that is exchanged through the new 
gates produced by new technologies. I would like to suggest that to 
benefit the longevity of the architectural profession we must be 
willing to push its limits and take the responsibility to educate 
students who will create practices that do not fall within these 
boundaries, as blurry as they have become. 
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NEW CURRICULAR CHALLENGES 

Technologies and scientific discourses can be partially under- 
stood as formalizations, i.e., as frozen moments, of the fluid 
social interactions constituting them, but they should also be 
viewed as instruments for enforcing meanings. The boundary 
is permeable between tool and myth, instrument and conceDt. . , 
historical systems of social re~atibns and historical anatomies 
of possible bodies, including objects of knowledge. Indeed, 
myth and tool mutually constitute each other.I8 

A curriculum is a set of courses constituting an area of specializa- 
tion; the focus is on time, units, skills, data, and sequences organiz- 
ing a codification of quantifiable knowledge and abilities into a 
structured chart of relationships. There are other ways of looking at 
a "curriculum." The word curriculum comes from currere, to run. 
Like a current it is both present time, of the moment, but also a fluid 
body moving continuously. It is possible to conceive a cumculum 
in this way, to recognize it as a structure that forms connections 
within the fluid condition that is our multicentered and fragmented 
environment. If education can no longer describe a discrete, con- 
tained body of knowledge, or offer a unified paradigm in response 
to a civic or social claim, it may instead be able to offer multiple and 
flexible trajectories into and through the new practices shaping our 
physical and virtual environment. 

Today, colleges and universities are asked to meet two significant 
requirements: first, to equip students with critical knowledge about 
power relations and social processes in a period of rapid information 
exchange and, second, to train graduates for jobs in the global 
marketplace. Current structures of architectural education do not 
adequately address these conflicting  requirement^.'^ We need to 
create a new nonhomorreneous mace for architectural discourse that - 
includes both normative and new practices, mediates between the 
profession and the schools, and uses this knowledge to inform 
architectural pedagogy. Recent discussions around the structure of 
architectural education have been reduced to an accounting of credit 
hours and the number of years required for a professional degree 
rather than the changing structure of the educational environment. 

Typically discussions of the relationship between the profession 
and the academy take the form of a jeremiad, a prolonged lamenta- 
tion or complaint, rather than looking to new and alternative Drat- - 
tices, technologies, communities, and environments and how they 
may be brought into how and what we tea~h.~OMired in a series of 
single-issue debates over the role of liberal arts education, degree 
designation, the gap between theory and practice, and the split 
between social and formal concerns in design architectural educa- 
tors have not seen or engaged the variety of possibilities that 
surround them. We are losing our ability to act as agents in the 
formation of architecture. On the other hand, evaluative surveys and 
studies of the "state of education," such as the recent Building 
Community: A New Future forArchitecture Education and Practice, 
which are typically commissioned by a compendium of institutions, 
have to answer to too many constituencies to be of any great use.*' 

Numerous schools, ACSA conferences, and AIA committees 
have taken up the pressing topic of the restructuring of architectural 
practice within the context of globalization, the shift from hard to 
soft technologies, flexible economies, and contemporary urban and 
environmental concerns.22 Although now celebrating new forms of 
practice, these groups often dismiss the need to consider new forms 
of practice within the academy and instead call for tightening 
professional education to close the gap between the schools and the 
profession. 

While this might be a legitimate way to address some of the 
conditions that maintain the "gap," it does little to address the 
problems of legitimacy confronting the profession and its educa- 
tional system. To properly consider the shifting terrain of practice 
described by many contemporary authors requires a rethinking of 
architectural education beyond the "gap between education and 

practice." While the gap may indeed by very wide, its scope of 
concern is very narrow. As bell hooks writes: 

Postmodern culture with its decentered subject can be the space 
where ties are severed or it can provide the occasion for new and 
varied forms of bonding. To some extent, ruptures, surfaces, 
contextuality, and a host of other happenings create gaps that 
make space for oppositional practices which no longer require 
intellectuals to be confined by narrow separate spheres with no 
meaningful connection to the world of the e~eryday.~ '  

In order to acknowledge shifting practices we need to shift the 
discipline of architecture itself -its formal, conceptual, and skills- 
based knowledge. We need to educate students not only to accom- 
modate themselves to the vicissitudes ahead but also enable them to 
become active agents in their own education and career choices. 
Their education should combine an understanding of physical space 
with knowledge of the processes that shape this space - allowing 
them to see these new processes not as negative challenges but as 
creative possibilities. 

CONCLUSION 

If architectural practices are indeed becoming more interdiscipli- 
nary and if increasing numbers of graduates are shifting into fields 
not traditionally seen as architectural, what are the possible re- 
sponses for architectural education? I would like to outline one 
possible proposal that offers an offensive rather than defensive 
response to disciplinary change. I propose that we clarify the 
position of professional education by situating it within graduate 
programs. This would enable an opening of opportunities within 
undergraduate programs, which would become strictly "pre-profes- 
sional." Although at first glance this would appear to constrain the 
current diversity of programs in the United States and around the 
world, upon closer inspection it provides a more flexible structure 
that would resolve a number of the conflicts described above. 

First, no longer focused on the singular pursuit of an architectural 
degree, graduates of undergraduate programs can situate themselves 
within other practices in order to enlarge the public understanding of 
the physical knvironment and the role of architecture in shaping it. 
This has the ootential to enhance the environment in which architec- 
ture operates by enlarging the public educated in architecture. Studio 
should still remain at the core of this education because it is the 
problem-solving, process-oriented abilities and ways of thinking 
that can be extended to other disciplines and careers. Pre-profes- 
sional programs can vary more broadly from school to school in 
response to the needs of local constituencies. What all such pro- 
grams would share would be a concentration on the discipline of 
architecture, a broadened liberal arts core, and an introduction to a 
broad array of post-graduate possibilities through an interdiscipli- 
nary "professional practices" course and a "coop" opportunity for 
upper-level students. Equipped with a broader range of information 
about post-graduate opportunities students can take greater respon- 
sibility for their education and career choices. 

Second, professional graduate programs can become sites of 
research and global exchange. Students will enter such programs 
more broadly educated in both the liberal arts and architecture. 
Standard "professional practice" courses and studio projects could 
take on the more complex demands of the practice of architecture 
within a restructured global environment, engaging more diverse 
programs, constituencies, and sites. 

Third, this structure addresses the diversification of graduate 
programs that is already occurring. Specialized graduate programs 
in digital design, for instance, are springing up around the United 
States and Canada. Such programs are better suited to students who 
want to work in the design of virtual rather than physical space. 
Other interdisciplinary graduate programs are also possible under 
such a model. All graduate programs should require extracurricular 



CONSTRUCTING NEW WORLDS 

practical experience a s  part of  the educational program, carefully 
tied to the research and professional concerns of each cumculum. 

Like the tools and technologies that we  use to shape our environ- 
ment, the curricular structure that we  utilize to educate our students 
is  not value-free. This  proposal does not resolve all of the difficulties 
inherent in the restructured global environment of architecture, and 
there is  not space here to g o  into the detailed reworking of licensing, 
accreditation, and course content that such a proposal requires. It 
does suggest, however, that compelling contemporary educational 
structures to meet the complex demands of today's practices is 
simultaneously repressive and inadequate. A more radical shift is 
required. 

Finally, an active engagement with new disciplines, technologies, 
communities, and environments is  one route toward the diversifica- 
tion of  the profession. Many schools are actively involved in  
rethinking the history and theory curriculum to take o n  the questions 
raised by the global environment of architecture and the diversity of  
populations for  and with whom w e  build. W e  have the opportunity 
and responsibility to respond to  and reflect the cultural diversity of 
the communities w e  serve, to answer the questions: what is our 
context, who are our  students, what d o  they want from their educa- 
tion, and what are we  educating them for? Each institution will ask 
these questions differently and build a cumculum around their 
answers. Even within a global environment, flexible and constantly 
undergoing restructuring, w e  are always engaged within a specific 
context. Education must mirror the flexibility that our multicentered 
and fragmented environments and professions engender and em- 
power students to  work within them. 
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